UNOFFICIAL COPY AS OF 02/16/12
12 REG. SESS.
12 RS HB 215/HCS 1


AN ACT relating to electrical inspections and licensure.

Be it enacted by the General Assembly of the Commonwealth of Kentucky:

SECTION 1.   A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A IS CREATED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
Any person who constructs, alters, or repairs any electrical wiring shall apply for a permit prior to beginning the installation. An installation shall not begin before the application for the permit has been filed. However, a person exempt under subsection (2) of Section 7 of this Act shall not be required to possess or show proof of an electrical license in order to obtain the permit required by this section.

(2)
The applicant for an electrical permit, by the act of applying for the permit, shall be deemed to consent to inspection of the installation by authorized inspectors of the Commonwealth of Kentucky and of the relevant city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, or consolidated local government.

(3)
The permit shall specify:

(a)
The name of the person performing the work;

(b)
The full description detailing the extent of the work to be performed;

(c)
The name of the owner or owners of the property where the work is to be performed;

(d)
The location of the property where the work is to be performed, including the street address and county; and

(e)
The license numbers of the licensees necessary to perform the work permitted.

(4)
A person shall not hinder an inspector enforcing any of the provisions of Sections 1 to 13 of this Act in the performance of the lawful duties authorized by Sections 1 to 13 of this Act.

SECTION 2.   A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A IS CREATED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
The department shall appoint and assign electrical inspectors to each county subject to the provisions of Sections 1 to 13 of this Act and in numbers sufficient to implement the provisions of Sections 1 to 13 of this Act.

(2)
A person shall not be appointed as an electrical inspector unless he or she is a certified electrical inspector pursuant to the requirements of Section 9 of this Act.

(3)
Except for those persons appointed to the committee pursuant to Section 13 of this Act, no person appointed or employed by the Commonwealth, a county, city, or other authorized jurisdiction to administer, regulate, or inspect electrical work shall have any pecuniary interest in any electrical business during the person's employment with the government or authorized jurisdiction. 

(4)
When an electrician, master electrician, or electrical contractor is appointed or employed as an electrical inspector, that person's electrician, master electrician, or electrical contractor license or certificate shall become inactive. Upon termination of the appointment or employment as an electrical inspector, the person's electrician, master electrician, or electrical contractor license or certificate may be reactivated without examination, by written request to the department and payment of a reactivation fee.

SECTION 3.   A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A IS CREATED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
The department, with the approval of the committee, upon the request of any individual local governing entity or combination of entities with existing electrical permitting and inspection programs as of January 1, 2013, shall authorize them to:

(a)
Administer, carry out, and enforce the administrative regulations of the department relating to electrical installations, alterations, and repairs;

(b)
Issue permits;

(c)
Make inspections within their respective boundaries; or

(d)
Perform any portion of these functions. 


Nothing in Sections 1 to 13 of this Act shall prohibit these entities from continuing to include other electrical work within their permitting and inspection program in the absence of a state requirement, if the work was included in the entity’s inspection program prior to January 1, 2013.

(2)
The department, with the approval of the committee, may authorize any other individual local government entities or combination of entities to:

(a)
Administer, carry out, and enforce the administrative regulations of the department relating to electrical installations, alterations, and repairs;

(b)
Issue permits;

(c)
Make inspections within their respective boundaries; or

(d)
Perform any portion of these functions. 


When authorization is granted, the department shall enter into contractual arrangements with the local governing entities, which shall remain in effect as long as the local entity continues to operate its program within the department's guidelines.

(3)
A permit issued by an authorized local governing entity shall be considered a permit issued by the department and all fees collected by the authorized local government related to the permit shall be retained by that local government.

(4)
An electrical inspector employed by, contracted for, or contracting with an authorized local governing entity shall verify required electrical licensure on projects within the local program’s jurisdiction. An electrical inspector shall report all electrical licensure violations to the department within ten (10) days of discovery.

(5)
A local governing entity shall not impose any other additional electrical inspection or permit requirements or establish any local inspection and permitting programs unless the local governing entity:

(a)
Has its electrical inspection or permit programs or requirements in place before January 1, 2013. Under this paragraph, the local governing entity shall not alter, add, or remove any program or requirement on or after January 1, 2013, without the specific permission of the department; or

(b)
Is granted permission by the department under subsection (2) of this section to impose the electrical inspection or permit programs or requirements.

SECTION 4.   A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A IS CREATED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
Installation, removal, or maintenance of load control or energy conservation devices on customer properties by an electric utility or an electric cooperative under the jurisdiction of the Kentucky Public Service Commission shall be performed by an electrician or master electrician.

(2)
Notwithstanding subsection (1) of this section, installation of low-voltage, power-limited load control or energy conservation devices separated from a power source by a Class 2 or Class 3 transformer shall not require an electrician or master electrician if the installation complies with KRS 227A.150.

(3)
An inspection shall not be required for any installation, removal, or maintenance conducted pursuant to this section.

Section 5.   KRS 227.460 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

Sections 1 to 13 of this Act[KRS 227.450 to 227.500] shall not apply to installations under the exclusive control of electric utilities for the purpose of communication, metering, or for the generation, control, transformation, transmission and distribution of electric energy located in buildings used exclusively by utilities for such purposes or located outdoors on property owned or leased by the utility or on public highways, streets or roads, or outdoors by established rights on private property.

Section 6.   KRS 227.470 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

(1)
Any action authorized by the provisions of Sections 1 to 13 of this Act[KRS 227.450 to 227.500] to be accomplished by a city or county may be undertaken cooperatively by two (2) or more local governments upon a resolution by the governing body of each local government to do so. Such cooperative agreements shall conform to the provisions of KRS Chapter 65.

(2)
If the governing body of two (2) or more counties authorizes a cooperative agreement, the individual cities within those counties do not have to execute the cooperative agreement and are deemed to be a party to the cooperative agreement for all purposes unless, within sixty (60) days after the adoption of the legislation authorizing the cooperative agreement by the county fiscal court in which that city is located, a resolution is passed by a city expressing its intent not to enter into a cooperative agreement.

(3)
A city that passes a resolution expressing its intent not to enter into a cooperative agreement with the county fiscal court shall both meet the statutory criteria for and establish an authorized electrical inspection program in accordance with Section 3 of this Act. If the city fails to establish an authorized electrical inspection program, a certified electrical inspector employed by the department shall assert jurisdiction, and inspect projects for a fee, within the city.

Section 7.   KRS 227.480 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

(1)
Each[A] city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government,[or] consolidated local government, or combination of entities, when authorized by the department shall, according to the Uniform State Building Code as it pertains to the plan review and inspection responsibilities of local governments, require any person to obtain permits before commencing construction, alteration, or repairs of any electrical wiring. The authorized city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, or consolidated local government shall require all inspections that are deemed necessary by the department for the safety of life and property. The department shall promulgate administrative regulations to describe the circumstances where inspections are required.

(2)
The department, or each[A] city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government,[ or] consolidated local government, or combination of entities, when authorized by the department,[ or the state] shall only[not] issue a permit if[unless] the applicant submits proof of being licensed as an electrical contractor under this chapter[KRS Chapter 227A] or of acting on behalf of a licensed electrical contractor. However, the provisions of this subsection shall not apply to the primary residence of a homeowner, a[ or] farmer who does construction, alteration, or repairs of any electrical wiring on his or her own farm,[premises] or any other person exempt from licensing under KRS 227A.030. This subsection shall not apply to electrical work performed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky, a city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government,[or] consolidated local government, or any subdivision thereof.

(3)
Each[A] city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government,[or] consolidated local government, or combination of entities, when authorized by the department shall[ appoint and may] fix the compensation of city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, or consolidated local government electrical inspectors employed, contracted for, or contracted with that governmental entity, and shall[may] by ordinance fix reasonable fees for additional inspection and permitting requirements established before January 1, 2013, and in accordance with Section 3 of this Act[and establish other requirements for the conduct of electrical inspections within its boundaries]. All electrical inspectors shall[must] be certified under Section 9 of this Act[KRS 227.489].

(4)
Reasonable standards for the construction, alteration, and repair of any electrical wiring shall be those adopted in the Uniform State Building Code, as promulgated by the Board of Housing, Buildings and Construction, and shall have as a minimum standard the requirements of the National Electric Code. These standards shall be used by the electrical inspector in making his or her inspections.

SECTION 8.   KRS 227.487 IS REPEALED AND REENACTED AS A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

The following requirements shall apply to all electrical work requiring a permit:

(1)
The inspector shall complete and retain a report for each inspection in the format approved by the department. One (1) copy of any cited electrical installation violations shall be given to the owner of the electrical installation or the owner’s authorized agent at the time the inspection fees are paid. Authorized local inspection and permitting programs shall make inspection reports available to the department upon request. The report shall include but not be limited to the following:

(a)
The address of the building inspected;

(b)
Number of code violations, if any;

(c)
A description of each code violation, and any recommended change to correct the violation;

(d)
The date and time of day the inspection commenced;

(e)
The time, in hours and minutes, required for the complete inspection of electrical work permitted; and

(f)
The number of miles and hours and minutes of travel time incurred by the inspector for that inspection;

(2)
The department shall promulgate administrative regulations to establish:

(a)
A schedule of reasonable fees not to exceed actual costs to implement and administer electrical inspection programs;

(b)
Electrical inspection protocols that ensure timely and complete inspections with minimal interruption to the construction process; and

(c)
The design of reporting forms for electrical inspections that meet the requirements of subsection (1) of this section; and

(3)
Each inspector contracted for or contracted with a city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, consolidated local government, or combination of governing entities, when authorized by the department to administer, carry out, and enforce the administrative regulations of the department relating to electrical installations, alterations, or repairs shall furnish a bond of five thousand dollars ($5,000) with surety satisfactory to the department. Any inspector employed by a city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, consolidated local government, or combination of governing entities shall not be required to furnish a bond.

Section 9.   KRS 227.489 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

The commissioner[ of housing, buildings and construction] shall require electrical inspectors to be certified. Examinations shall be based on the National Electrical Code incorporated in the Uniform State Building Code and the standards of safety prescribed by the department. Electrical inspectors who have been engaged in the inspection of electrical light and power wiring installations, based on the requirements of the National Electrical Code, for a period of three (3) years, may be certified on the basis of knowledge of this subject and experience. No certificate shall be denied, suspended, or revoked unless the applicant or certificate holder is afforded the opportunity for a hearing in accordance with KRS Chapter 13B.

SECTION 10.   KRS 227.491 IS REPEALED AND REENACTED AS A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
An electrical inspector who certifies an electrical installation shall furnish and attach an approval sticker bearing his or her signature and certification number in a conspicuous place on the main service entrance equipment. The electrical inspector shall also provide the electrical installation owner or owner's authorized agent with a certificate of approval if one is requested. A complete record of each inspection shall be kept by the inspector in accordance with subsection (1) of Section 8 of this Act.

(2)
An electrical inspector shall not:

(a)
Certify unlawful electrical installations;

(b)
Certify or inspect an electrical installation in a manufactured home or mobile home where the certified installer seal is not present pursuant to KRS 227.570; or

(c)
Certify or inspect an electrical installation in a previously owned manufactured home or a previously owned mobile home when a Class B1 seal is not present as required by KRS 227.605.

(3)
An electrical inspector shall be subject to review by the commissioner with possible suspension of certification for a period not to exceed one (1) year from the date of the commissioner's ruling if that electrical inspector fails to comply with:

(a)
Subsection (2) of this section; or

(b)
Subsection (4) of Section 3 of this Act. 

Section 11.   KRS 227.492 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

It shall be the duty of the commissioner[ of housing, buildings and construction] to investigate alleged misconduct of any electrical inspector certified under Section 9 of this Act[KRS 227.489] when, in the opinion of the commissioner, there is sufficient evidence to suggest that such misconduct exists. By submitting a written request to the department, any party may initiate an investigation by[seek redress from] the commissioner when alleged misconduct of an electrical inspector is deemed to have worked an undue hardship on the party.

SECTION 12.   KRS 227.495 IS REPEALED AND REENACTED AS A NEW SECTION OF KRS CHAPTER 227A TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(1)
Electrical inspectors may take immediate action to prevent further electrical work at any inspection site where, in the judgment of the electrical inspector, imminent danger to life or property exists, or electrical work is being performed by unlicensed electricians where no licensure exemption is applicable. Actions the electrical inspector may take to address these dangers are the following:

(a)
Stop-work order regarding any electrical work at the inspection site; or

(b)
Recommendations of fines or other penalties as described in Section 17 of this Act.

(2)
A person, firm, or corporation shall not use, continue to use, or permit the use of any electrical installation that an authorized inspector determines was not installed in accordance with the Kentucky Building Code, the Kentucky Residential Code, and the referenced standards contained in the respective codes.

(3)
If a permit is required for the electrical work, a person, firm, or corporation shall not use, continue to use, or permit the use of the electrical installation unless the permit has been applied for or obtained.

(4)
Any electrical inspection required shall be scheduled with the property owner or owner’s authorized agent at least one (1) business day in advance and shall be completed without undue delay, but no later than three (3) days from the date of scheduling.

(5)
If an installation requiring a permit does not meet the requirements of the Kentucky Building Code or the Kentucky Residential Code, whichever is applicable, or if the property owner refuses to allow an inspection, the inspector shall refuse to approve the work covered by the permit. 

(6)
The findings of the electrical inspector under subsection (1) of this section shall be presumed to be correct until the city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, consolidated local government, the department, or the party affected by the findings demonstrates that it is more likely than not that the electrical inspector was incorrect in his or her findings.

(7)
The actions of an electrical inspector under this section are subject to misconduct investigation by the commissioner under Section 11 of this Act, and the inspector is subject to any appropriate criminal or civil penalty due to misconduct or violation of any provision of this chapter.

(8)
A permit holder aggrieved by an action of an inspector or the department may request a hearing in accordance with KRS Chapter 13B.

Section 13.   KRS 227.530 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

(1)
There is hereby created an Electrical Advisory Committee which shall be attached to the Electrical Division within the Department of Housing, Buildings and Construction for administrative purposes. The committee shall be constituted as follows:

(a)
Two (2) members chosen from public utility companies;

(b)
Two (2) members who are electricians;

(c)
Two (2) members who are certified electrical inspectors, one (1) of whom shall be employed by a governmental entity and the other who shall be an independent contractor engaged in the business of inspecting electrical installations;

(d)
Two (2) members who are licensed professional electrical engineers;

(e)
Two (2) members who are engaged in the business of electrical contracting; and

(f)
One (1) member who is engaged in the business of electrical contracting and who employs no more than five (5) full-time employees when appointed.

(2)
Committee members shall be appointed by the Governor for four (4) year terms. No committee member shall be appointed for more than one (1) successive term.

(3)
The committee shall meet at least quarterly or upon request of the department for the purpose of considering matters relating to electrical installations and electrical inspections. The committee shall have the opportunity to review and comment on relevant administrative regulations that are subject to the requirements of KRS 198B.030(8) and (9) and 198B.040(11) and shall make recommendations to and otherwise advise the department on these matters.

(4)
All committee members shall be compensated for expenses incurred in the conduct of Commonwealth business.

Section 14.   KRS 227A.010 is amended to read as follows:

As used in this chapter[KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140], unless the context otherwise requires:

(1)
"Alteration" means any change, modification, or adjustment to existing electrical wires or conduits;
(2)
"Authorized local licensing program" means any city, county, urban-county, charter county, or consolidated local government electrician and electrical contractor licensing program established by local ordinance for the purpose of licensing electrical workers. "Authorized local licensing program" shall include a licensing program established through a cooperative agreement between two (2) or more counties;

(3)[(2)]
"Commissioner" means the commissioner of the Department of Housing, Buildings and Construction;
(4)
"Committee" means the Electrical Advisory Committee as described in Section 13 of this Act[KRS 227.530];

(5)[(3)]
"Department" means the Department of Housing, Buildings and Construction;

(6)[(4)]
"Division" means the Electrical Division within the Department of Housing, Buildings and Construction;
(7)
"Electrical" pertains to the installation, alteration, or repair of wires and conduits for the purpose of transmitting electricity, and the installation of fixtures and equipment in connection therewith;

(8)[(5)]
"Electrical contractor" means any licensed individual, partnership, or corporation that is licensed to engage in, offers to engage in, or advertises or holds itself out to be qualified to engage in designing, planning, superintending, contracting of, or assuming responsibility for the installation, alteration, or repair of any electrical wiring used for the purpose of furnishing heat, light, or power, and employs electrical workers to engage in this practice. If the electrical contractor is not a master electrician, the electrical contractor shall employ at least one (1) full-time master electrician; however, no master electrician shall act in this capacity for more than one (1) electrical contractor;

(9)
"Electrical inspector" means any person certified by the commissioner under Section 9 of this Act who, for compensation, inspects the construction and installation of electrical conductors, fittings, devices, and fixtures for light, heat, or power service equipment to ascertain the compliance with the National Electrical Code incorporated in the Uniform State Building Code promulgated pursuant to KRS 198B.050 or the standards of safety of the Commonwealth of Kentucky;

(10)[(6)]
"Electrician" means any person licensed by the department who is employed by an electrical contractor and is engaged in the construction, alteration, or repair of any electrical wiring used for the purpose of furnishing heat, light, or power;

(11)[(7)]
"Maintenance worker or maintenance engineer" means a person who is a regular, bona fide employee or agent of a property owner, property lessor, property management company, or firm that is not in the electrical business but has jurisdiction over the property where the routine maintenance of electrical systems is being performed;

(12)[(8)]
"Master electrician" means any individual licensed to assume responsible charge, supervision, or direction of an electrician engaged in the construction, installation, alteration, or repair of electrical wiring used to furnish heat, light, or power;[ and]
(13)
"Repair" means the reconstruction or renewal of any part of an existing building for the purpose of its maintenance; and

(14)[(9)]
"Routine maintenance of electrical systems" means the routine and periodic servicing of electrical systems, including cleaning, inspecting, and making adjustments to ensure the proper operation and the removal or replacement of component parts. "Routine maintenance of electrical systems" does not include the installation of complete electrical systems.

Section 15.   KRS 227A.030 is amended to read as follows:

(1)
The provisions of KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall not apply to installations under the exclusive control of electric utilities for the purpose of communication, metering, or for the generation, control, transformation, transmission, and distribution of electric energy located in buildings used exclusively by utilities for those purposes or located outdoors on property owned or leased by the utility or on public highways, streets, or roads, or outdoors by established rights on private property.

(2)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall require that a maintenance worker or maintenance engineer performing routine maintenance of electrical systems be licensed.

(3)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall prohibit or interfere with the ability of a homeowner or farmer to install or repair electrical wiring on his or her real property.

(4)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall require that a retailer or its agent engaged in making installations of an appliance purchased at a retail establishment be licensed.

(5)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall be construed to require persons making installations exempt by Section 5 of this Act[KRS 227.460] to be licensed or to work for a licensed person.

(6)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall preclude the use of unlicensed, nonresident electricians in temporary, emergency, or industrial shutdown situations. Those unlicensed, nonresident electricians shall apply for an electrician's license or a master electrician's license after they are employed and engaged in electrical work in the Commonwealth of Kentucky for a period of ten (10) days. No unlicensed, nonresident electrician shall be employed or engaged in electrical work in the Commonwealth of Kentucky for a total of more than thirty (30) days in any calendar year without applying for an electrician's license or a master electrician's license. The license shall be obtained by the temporary, unlicensed, nonresident electricians within sixty (60) days of securing employment.

(7)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall apply to a person performing work at a surface or underground coal mine or at a coal preparation plant.

(8)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall apply to a person performing work for a telecommunications company for which the voltage is fifty (50) volts or less.

(9)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall prohibit a factory-authorized representative from the installation, maintenance, or service of a medical equipment device. This exemption does not include work providing electrical feeds into the power distribution unit or installation of conduits and raceways. This exemption covers only those factory engineers or third-party service companies with equivalent training who are qualified to perform such service.

(10)
Nothing in KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall apply to low-voltage, power-limited installations for control or coordination of interconnected devices separated from a power source by a Class 2 or Class 3 transformer installed by a person licensed as:

(a)
A master or journeyman heating, ventilation, and air conditioning technician employed by a licensed HVAC contractor pursuant to KRS 198B.658;

(b)
A fire protection sprinkler contractor pursuant to KRS 198B.560;

(c)
A manufactured housing dealer or certified installer pursuant to KRS 227.610;

(d)
A boiler mechanic pursuant to KRS 236.210;

(e)
A master or journeyman plumber pursuant to KRS 318.030;

(f)
An onsite sewage disposal system installer pursuant to KRS 211.357; or

(g)
An electrician or master electrician employed by an electrical contractor pursuant to KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140.

(11)
The provisions of KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall not apply to work performed at industrial manufacturing facilities or natural gas pipeline facilities by employees of those facilities.

Section 16.   KRS 227A.050 is amended to read as follows:

(1)
All fees and other moneys received by the department under the provisions of this chapter[KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140] shall be deposited in the State Treasury to the credit of a revolving trust and agency account[fund] for use by the department for the administration and enforcement responsibilities of the division. The moneys in the account are hereby appropriated by the General Assembly for the purposes set forth in this chapter[in administering the provisions of KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140].

(2)
Notwithstanding KRS 45.229, no part of this revolving trust and agency account[fund] shall revert to the general fund[funds] of the Commonwealth.

(3)
Any interest accrued on balances of this revolving trust and agency account shall be deposited into the account[An authorized local licensing program under KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140 shall negotiate with the department the amount of the fees to be retained by the authorized local licensing program.

(4)
Funds for the initial administration of KRS 227A.010 to 227A.140, following June 24, 2003, and to the extent fee income is insufficient to meet actual costs as determined by the chief budget officer for the department, shall be borrowed from surplus trust and agency accounts of the department and repaid without interest over no more than the succeeding two (2) fiscal years].

Section 17.   KRS 227A.130 is repealed, reenacted as a new section of KRS Chapter 227A, and amended to read as follows:

(1)
Any person who violates or aids in the violation of any provision of KRS 227A.020 shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction shall be fined not less than five hundred dollars ($500) nor more than five thousand dollars ($5,000), or sentenced to jail for not less than ten (10) nor more than one hundred eighty (180) days, or both.

(2)
A city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, or consolidated local government may fix as a penalty for the violation of any ordinance or resolution passed under the provisions of this chapter, a fine of not less than twenty-five dollars ($25) nor more than two hundred fifty dollars ($250) for each offense.

(3)
Except for violations of KRS 227A.020, and in addition to any penalty enforced under subsection (2) of this section, any person who violates any provision of this chapter, any administrative regulation adopted under this chapter, or any provision of the state's adopted electrical code shall be fined not less than one thousand dollars ($1,000) nor more than two thousand dollars ($2,000), disciplined under the provisions of the administrative regulations adopted under this chapter, or both for each offense. Each day the violation continues shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 18.   KRS 132.815 is amended to read as follows:

(1)
Each electrical inspector certified under Section 9 of this Act[KRS 227.489] shall submit a monthly report to the Department of Revenue showing the names and addresses of all persons, firms, or corporations for which inspections were conducted for new buildings, new or relocated mobile homes, and other new or relocated structures during the preceding month. Each building, mobile home, or other structure shall be identified by county and property address, or property location in those instances where the address is insufficient to reveal the physical location of the property.

(2)
The information provided shall be used for the purpose of making and maintaining accurate assessment records. The Department of Revenue shall provide to each electrical inspector the necessary forms and instructions for filing the report required under subsection (1) of this section.

Section 19.   KRS 198B.060 is amended to read as follows:

(1)
Each local government shall employ a building official or inspector and other code enforcement personnel as necessary, or shall contract for inspection and code enforcement services in accordance with subsections (8) and (11) of this section to enforce the Uniform State Building Code within the boundaries of its jurisdiction, except that permits, inspections, and certificates of occupancy shall not be mandatory for single-family residences unless a local government passes an ordinance requiring inspections of single-family residences.

(2)
Local governments shall be responsible for the examination and approval or disapproval of plans and specifications for churches having a capacity of four hundred (400) or less persons, and six thousand (6,000) or less square feet of total floor area, and buildings of no more than three (3) stories in height, exclusive of attic and basement, which do not contain more than twenty thousand (20,000) square feet of floor area, and are not intended for educational, institutional, or high hazard occupancy; or assembly, business, or industrial occupancy in excess of one hundred (100) persons, except churches as stated in this subsection, or for use as a frozen food locker plant as defined in KRS 221.010. Local governments shall be responsible for the issuance and revocation of building permits, licenses, certificates, and similar documents which cover activities within their area of responsibility, and the inspection of all buildings pursuant to the provisions of this chapter and the Uniform State Building Code. Each local government issuing a building or demolition permit or an initial certificate of occupancy on a new structure shall send a copy of the permit or certificate to the commissioner for his or her use in maintaining an accurate housing inventory for Kentucky.

(3)
Urban-county governments may determine service districts within their boundaries within which farm dwellings and other farm buildings, not used in the business of retail trade or as a place of regular employment for ten (10) or more people, shall be exempt from the requirements of the Uniform State Building Code. The determination may be reviewed and altered by the board.

(4)
With the exception of single-family dwellings, the department shall be responsible for the examination and approval or disapproval of plans and specifications for all buildings which are not the responsibility of local governments. The department may issue and revoke permits, licenses, certificates, and similar documents within its area of responsibility, and shall have concurrent jurisdiction with local governments for the inspection of all buildings pursuant to the provisions of this chapter and the Uniform State Building Code. If the commissioner determines that the local jurisdiction is not adequately performing any portion of its program, he or she may recommend to the board that the department preempt that portion of a local program, except that the commissioner shall not preempt or assert jurisdiction for the enforcement of the code on single-family dwellings. The commissioner shall explain his or her reasons for preemption in writing and provide a copy to the board and the local jurisdiction. The local jurisdiction may appeal the recommended preemption directly to the board, and the board shall review the appeal according to the procedures found in subsections (8) to (10) of KRS 198B.070. No preemption by the department shall take place until the final decision of the board. If the department preempts any portion of a local program, it shall collect the fees applicable to that portion of the program.

(5)
Any local government may petition the commissioner requesting that additional plan review functions be allocated to that local government. The petition shall include evidence of the local government's capability to perform additional plan review functions. The commissioner, after review of the petition and supporting evidence, may grant or deny to the local government any part of a request for additional responsibility. If the commissioner denies any part of a petition, he or she shall explain his or her reasons for denial in writing, and provide a copy to the board and the local government. A local government may appeal the denial directly to the board, and the board shall review the appeal according to the procedures found in subsections (8) to (10) of KRS 198B.070. If the local government is granted additional responsibility by the commissioner or the board, the department shall hold concurrent jurisdiction over the additional responsibility, but the local government shall collect any fees for functions it performs pursuant to the additional responsibility.

(6)
(a)
Any local government may also petition the commissioner requesting that plans and specifications inspection, building inspection, and approval responsibility relating to the application of local plumbing permits or local electrical permits for local installations be allocated to the local government.

(b)
For plumbing permits, the petition shall not be granted unless the local government has demonstrated to the commissioner that it can perform these functions in accordance with the provisions of KRS 198B.050 to 198B.090.

(c)
For electrical permits, the petition shall not be granted unless the local government has demonstrated to the commissioner that it meets the requirements of KRS Chapter 227A.
(7)
The commissioner shall expedite the review of plans and specifications by assigning responsibilities and coordinating review activities among the department's various functional divisions so as to prevent unnecessary duplication in the review of plans and specifications.

(8)
No building shall be constructed in this state until a local building official and an official representing the department, if the department has jurisdiction, issue a permit for the construction. Nothing in this subsection shall require a single-family dwelling to be permitted or inspected unless a local government has established a building inspection program as set out in this section.

(9)
The local building official or the representative of the department shall issue a permit if the proposed building satisfies the requirements of the Uniform State Building Code and if the party desiring to construct the building has complied with all other legal requirements concerning the location and construction of the building. The applicant for a building permit, by the act of applying for the permit, shall be deemed to have consented to inspection by the local government or the department, of the building during construction and upon the completion of construction for the purpose of determining that the building is constructed in compliance with the Uniform State Building Code.

(10)
(a)
No permit for building, construction, reconstruction, renovation, demolition, or maintenance or for any activity related to building, construction, reconstruction, renovation, demolition, or maintenance shall be issued by any building department or by any political subdivision of the Commonwealth of Kentucky to any person seeking the permit unless the person shall assure, by affidavit, that all contractors and subcontractors employed, or that will be employed, on activity covered by the permit shall be in compliance with Kentucky requirements for workers' compensation insurance according to KRS Chapter 342 and unemployment insurance according to KRS Chapter 341.

(b)
Any person who fails to comply with the assurances required under paragraph (a) of this subsection upon such finding by a court of competent jurisdiction, shall be fined an amount not to exceed four thousand dollars ($4,000) or an amount equal to the sum of all uninsured and unsatisfied claims brought under the provisions of KRS Chapter 342 and unemployment insurance claims for which no wages were reported as required by KRS Chapter 341, whichever is greater.

(c)
The penalty imposed in paragraph (b) of this subsection shall be enforced by the county attorney for the county in which the violation occurred.

(11)
A certified electrical inspector shall be provided by the state, or shall be employed by, or contracted for, or contracted with a city, county, urban-county, charter county, unified local government, consolidated local government, or combination of governing entities, when authorized by the department to administer, carry out, and enforce the administrative regulations of the department relating to electrical installations, alterations, or repairs[local government having responsibility over buildings as set out in this section as part of its building inspection program]. After a certified electrical inspector has been provided for by the local government or the department, no utility shall initiate permanent electrical service to any new building, or any building which has been moved, until a final certificate of approval has been issued by a certified electrical inspector.[ Unless the department shall notify the utility in writing as to which buildings are subject to department approval, it shall be presumed by the utility that the building is subject to the jurisdiction of the local government. However,] Nothing in this section shall prohibit the supply or use of necessary electrical services during the construction and testing process.

(12)
This section shall apply to industrialized building systems, but destructive disassembly of industrialized building systems which carry a seal of approval pursuant to a manufactured building law in the state in which they were manufactured, which seal of approval is accepted by the Board of Housing, Buildings and Construction, shall not be performed in order to conduct the tests or inspections.

(13)
No building on which construction was begun nor any industrialized building system on which site preparation and assembly were begun after the Uniform State Building Code became effective shall be occupied until the local building official or a representative of the department issues a certificate of occupancy certifying that the building was constructed in conformance with the standards of the Uniform State Building Code, or assembled or installed in conformance with applicable instructions. Nothing in this subsection shall be construed to require a certificate of occupancy to be issued for any single-family dwelling unless a local government has established jurisdiction for the enforcement of the Uniform State Building Code under this section.

(14)
A local government may associate with other local governments, and may seek the technical assistance of other agencies or area development districts in order to provide for the local enforcement of the Uniform State Building Code.

(15)
Local governments or associations of local governments may contract with a person, firm, or company to perform the plans and specifications inspection or building inspection functions required of the local government by the provisions of this section if:

(a)
The person performing the plans and specifications inspection is certified by the department as having successfully completed the test requirements provided by KRS 198B.090 to practice as a certified plans and specifications inspector;

(b)
The person performing the building inspection is certified by the department as having successfully completed the test requirements provided in KRS 198B.090 to practice as a certified building inspector;

(c)
The person, firm, or company does not have a conflict of interest between its plan review or inspection functions and any other employment or business activities;

(d)
The person performing the plumbing inspection is certified by the department as having successfully completed the requirements provided in KRS 318.140 to practice as a certified plumbing inspector; and

(e)
The person, firm, or company does not have a conflict of interest between its plan review or inspection functions and any other employment or business activities.

(16)
If the department has reason to believe that an inspector is not enforcing, or is improperly enforcing, the provisions of the Kentucky building codes, it shall conduct an informal hearing to review the inspector's procedures and return in written form the required corrections resulting from the hearing to the inspector, or may take action to suspend or revoke the inspector's certificate.

(17)
If, after written notification from the department to the inspector of any corrections required, the inspector fails to comply within sixty (60) days, the department shall suspend the inspector's certification until the inspector complies. Any action to suspend or revoke an inspector's certificate may be appealed to the board, and upon appeal an administrative hearing shall be conducted in accordance with KRS Chapter 13B.

(18)
Each local government and the department may establish a schedule of fees for the functions performed under the provisions of this chapter. The fees shall be designed to fully cover the cost of the service performed but shall not exceed the cost of the service performed. Fees payable to the department shall be paid into the State Treasury and credited to a trust and agency fund to be used by the department in carrying out the provisions of this chapter. No part of this fund shall revert to the general fund of the Commonwealth.

Section 20.   KRS 211.350 is amended to read as follows:

(1)
The cabinet shall regulate the construction, installation, or alteration of on-site sewage disposal systems except for systems that have a surface discharge. The cabinet shall create and maintain an electronic database for Kentucky on-site wastewater systems information, which for each system shall include but not be limited to permit application date, permit application status, system installation date, system type, latitude and longitude of system, records of system plan and site evaluations, inspection dates, and the condition of system at time of inspection. The cabinet shall within twenty-four (24) months of July 12, 2006, annually report to the Governor and the Legislative Research Commission on the status of on-site systems statewide, including numbers and types of systems, summaries of conditions of systems, geographic distribution, observations of trends, and recommendation for future protection of public health and safety with on-site sewage disposal systems.

(2)
The Department for Public Health shall maintain a current list of approved and experimental on-site wastewater treatment technologies and shall make this list available, and guidance and expertise, to local health departments, which will provide it to on-site wastewater professionals and permit applicants.

(3)
Site evaluations shall be completed by the local health department within fifteen (15) working days of receipt of the application. If further information is required, the local health department shall promptly notify the applicant and shall have an additional ten (10) working days after that submittal of additional information in which to evaluate and issue or deny the permit. It shall be the responsibility of the property owner or owner's agent to protect and maintain the suitability of an approved site and to notify the local health department for a reinspection if site conditions substantively change. If a site previously determined to be suitable is thereafter declared unsuitable by the local health department, remedial measures shall be provided in writing to the property owner or owner's agent within fifteen (15) working days.

(4)
After the conclusion of the site evaluation, the local health department shall, upon request, provide a list of all options that may be approved for the property, including new and emerging technologies. It shall be the responsibility of the owner of advanced treatment, alternative, experimental, or new and emerging technology systems to contract with a management entity, certified system operator, or trained system operator to develop and implement an approved operations and maintenance plan specific to, and appropriate for, the approved system.

(5)
No person, firm, or corporation shall construct, install, alter, or cause to be constructed, installed, or altered, any on-site sewage disposal system subject to regulation by the cabinet without having first obtained an on-site sewage disposal permit from the local health department. In lieu of inspection and certification by the local health department a licensed professional engineer in private practice licensed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky may perform site evaluations and approve system designs for an on-site sewage disposal system for the person, firm, or corporation and apply for the permit from the local health department. The final systems installation inspection shall be performed by the local health department as soon as practicable. All applicable provisions of KRS Chapter 322 shall govern the licensed professional engineer. A professional engineer shall not perform site evaluations, approve system designs, or certify system installations of an on-site sewage disposal system on property owned by himself, an employee, or a partner of an engineering firm by which he is employed, or on property owned by the engineering firm. Nothing in this section shall be construed to deny a farmstead owner the right to obtain a permit. Except for farmstead owners on their own property, the construction, installation, or alteration shall be performed only by a person certified by the cabinet pursuant to KRS 211.357.

(6)
A local health department that issues a permit for an on-site sewage disposal system based on the site evaluation or system design of a licensed professional engineer in private practice licensed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky shall not be held liable for any defects or failures of the on-site sewage disposal system due to the site evaluation or system design.

(7)
No person, firm, or corporation shall use or continue to use or permit the use or continued use of any on-site sewage disposal system that is constructed, installed, or altered under an on-site sewage disposal permit if the cabinet or local health department through a duly authorized inspector, employee, agent, or licensed professional engineer in private practice licensed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky finds that the system was not constructed, installed, or altered in conformance with the permit and regulations issued by the cabinet.

(8)
No certified electrical inspector acting under authority of Section 10 of this Act[KRS 227.491] shall issue the certificates of approval of temporary or permanent electrical wiring unless the inspector has in his or her possession a notice of release as described in paragraphs (a) and (b) of this subsection. The inspector shall record the number of the notice of release on the certificate of approval. The person requesting approval of electrical wiring shall be responsible for obtaining the release from the local health department and providing it to the electrical inspector. This requirement shall only apply to dwellings, mobile homes, manufactured housing, buildings, or other structures that are constructed or installed after July 15, 1998. This requirement shall not apply to structures that do not have sewage waste fixtures or to those that are connected to a sewage waste disposal system approved by the Energy and Environment Cabinet. Nothing in this section shall be construed to deny the continued use of any electrical service connected to wiring approved prior to July 15, 1998.

(a)
An initial notice of release to allow temporary electrical power for construction shall be issued to the property owner or owner's agent by the local health department upon the application for a site evaluation.

(b)
A final notice of release to allow for permanent electrical power shall be issued to the property owner or owner's agent by the local health department upon approval of an on-site sewage disposal plan.

(c)
This section shall not apply to any county that has adopted the Uniform State Building Code and has and enforces on-site sewage disposal permitting.

(9)
All applications for on-site sewage disposal permits shall be accompanied by plans and specifications for the proposed system, including results of soils tests and other information as directed by the cabinet by regulation. If the site evaluation or approval of the system design is performed by a licensed professional engineer in private practice licensed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky, the application shall be accompanied by a statement by the engineer that he has met the requirements of the regulations issued by the cabinet for site evaluation and system design. Any action to deny an application shall be subject to appeal, and upon appeal an administrative hearing shall be conducted in accordance with KRS Chapter 13B.

(10)
The cabinet shall fix a schedule of fees for the functions performed by the cabinet relating to the regulation of on-site sewage disposal systems. The fees shall be designed to fully cover the cost of the service performed but shall not exceed the cost of the service performed. Fees payable to the cabinet shall be paid into the State Treasury and credited to a trust and agency fund to be used by the cabinet in carrying out its responsibilities relating to the regulation of on-site sewage disposal systems. No part of the fund shall revert to the general fund of the Commonwealth.

(11)
Any regulation relating to on-site sewage disposal that is in effect on July 15, 1992, shall remain in effect until altered by the secretary. The secretary may issue additional regulations necessary to carry out the purposes of this section.

(12)
Nothing in this section shall authorize or allow the cabinet to inspect or take enforcement action against on-site sewage disposal systems installed on farmsteads prior to July 15, 1992, or modifications to those systems unless the actions are determined in writing by the cabinet, upon a written, verified complaint, to be necessary to prevent imminent harm or damage to the safety, life, or health of a person. In this instance, the cabinet shall deliver to the landowner a copy of the written determination and the verified complaint prior to the commencement of the inspection or enforcement action.

Section 21.   KRS 227.205 is amended to read as follows:

The Department of Housing, Buildings and Construction (hereinafter referred to as the department of housing) is hereby created within the Public Protection Cabinet. The department shall be headed by a commissioner appointed by the Governor in accordance with KRS 12.040, and who shall report to the secretary of the Public Protection Cabinet. The office of the commissioner shall also include a deputy commissioner and an executive assistant to the commissioner, who shall be the policy making assistants to the commissioner and shall be appointed pursuant to KRS 12.050. The department shall consist of the Division of Fire Prevention, the Division of Building Codes Enforcement, the Division of Plumbing, the Electrical Division, and the Division of Heating, Ventilation, and Air Conditioning (HVAC).

Section 22.   The following KRS sections are repealed:

227.450   Definitions for KRS 227.450 to 227.500.

227.500   Authority to fix penalty.

Page 1 of 1
HB021530.100 - 93 - 4434

House Committee Substitute

